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ITEM 0102901 
 
RELAY FLAGSTONE WALK 
 
DESCRIPTION 
 
Work under this item shall include furnishing materials, equipment, and labor for 
relaying existing flagstone walk to line and grade, furnishing new sand where 
necessary to raise flagstones, filling joints and adding topsoil, grading and seeding 
where necessary along the walk edges.  
 
REFERENCED ITEMS 
 
Item 0106401 
 
REQUIRED SUBMITTALS 
 
None 
 
MATERIALS 
 
Topsoil, fertilizer, seed, lime, and mulch shall conform to the requirements of Item 
0106401. 
 
Sand shall meet the requirements of section M.03 of the State of Connecticut, 
Department of Transportation, Standard Specifications for Roads, Bridges and 
Incidental Construction, Form 816, 2004. 
 
CONSTRUCTION METHODS 
 
The flagstones shall be carefully removed and the foundation re-graded as required 
using the existing material or new sand shall be added if necessary. The flagstone 
shall be re-laid to proper line and grade and they shall be firmly bedded in the 
foundation so that no voids occur underneath them and the joints shall be 
completely filled with sand. 
 
The Contractor shall exercise care in the handling of the flagstones to avoid 
damaging them and shall use equipment necessary to lift the flagstones only from 
the edges of the walk and not between adjoining flagstones. 
 
If damage to the flagstones does occur due to the Contractor’s negligence, as 
determined by the Engineer, he shall replace them with flagstones in good 
condition at his own expense.  
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Where necessary the Contractor shall backfill along the edges with topsoil. The 
topsoil shall be graded to match the existing ground. Fertilizer, seed, lime and 
mulch shall then be applied in accordance with the Construction Methods of Item 
0106401. 
 
METHOD OF MEASUREMENT 
 
Relay flagstone walk will be measured for payment by the number of square feet of 
walk completed and accepted by the Engineer. 
 
BASIS OF PAYMENT 
 
This item will be paid for at the contract unit price per square foot for “RELAY 
FLAGSTONE WALK” complete in place which price shall include all materials, 
tools, equipment, labor and work incidental thereto.  
 
PAY ITEM DESCRIPTION PAY UNIT 
 0102901 Relay Flagstone Walk  SF 


